
        December 1, 2009 
 
 
 
IN THE MATTER OF 
RECEIVING BIDS FOR ASPHALT CONCRETE 
& BITUMINOUS MATERIAL SUPPLY 
 
 It being the hour of 1:45 P.m., E.S.T., the time set by the Board of Ottawa 
County Commissioners for the bid opening for 2010 Asphalt Concrete and 
Bituminous Material Supply the following bid(s) were received: 
 
Asphalt Materials 
Asphalt Concrete Type 1 #448: no bid 
Asphalt Concrete Base #301: no bid 
HFRS – 2: $1.87/gallon – delivered $1.80/gallon – picked-up 
MWS – 90: $1.87/gallon – delivered    $1.80/gallon – picked-up 
 
Erie Blacktop 
Asphalt Concrete Type 1 #448:  $57.75/Ton – Delivered    $49.75/Ton Picked-Up 
Asphalt Concrete Base #301:    $52.75/Ton – Delivered     $44.75/Ton Picked-Up 
HFRS – 2:  no bid 
MWS – 90: no bid 
 
Gerken Paving 
Asphalt Concrete Type 1 #448: $65.00/Ton – Delivered     $55.00/Ton Picked-Up 
Asphalt Concrete Base #301:    $61.00/Ton – Delivered     $51.00/Ton Picked-Up 
HFRS – 2:  no bid 
MWS – 90: no bid 
 
M & B Asphalt 
Asphalt Concrete Type 1 #448: $62.00/Ton – Delivered     $52.00/Ton Picked-Up 
Asphalt Concrete Base #301:    $58.00/Ton – Delivered     $48.00/Ton Picked-Up 
HFRS – 2:  no bid 
MWS – 90: no bid 
 
Shelly Materials 
Asphalt Concrete Type 1 #448: no bid – Delivered         $57.00/Ton Picked-Up 
Asphalt Concrete Base #301:    no bid – Delivered          $47.50/Ton Picked 
HFRS – 2:  no bid 
MWS – 90: no bid 
 
The Bid(s) will be reviewed. 
 
c:  Assistant Clerk  


	Asphalt Materials
	Erie Blacktop
	Gerken Paving
	M & B Asphalt
	Shelly Materials

