March 19, 2009

IN THE MATTER OF
RECEIVING BIDS FOR 2009
PIPE SUPPLY

It being the hour of 1:00 p.m., E.DT., the time set by the Board of Ottawa County
Commissioners for the bid opening for Supplying of Pipe for the County Engineer’'s office the
following bid(s) were received:

Contractor's Name: Independent Concrete Pipe

Unit Price Delivered Unit Price Picked-Up

RCP 127 $7.87/LIN FT $7.00/LIN FT
RCP 15” $11.45/LIN FT $10.00/LIN FT
RCP 18" $14.97/LIN FT $13.00/LIN FT
RCP 21" $17.20/LIN FT $15.00/LIN FT
RCP 24" $21.00/LIN FT $18.76/LIN FT
RCP 27" $31.25/LIN FT $27.00/LIN FT
RCP 30” $31.50/LIN FT $27.00/LIN FT
RCP 36" $43.00/LIN FT $36.50/LIN FT
RCP 427 $53.50/LIN FT $47.14/LIN FT
RCP 48” $69.00/LIN FT $60.75/LIN FT
HDPE 127 No Bid No Bid

HDPE 18~ No Bid No Bid

HDPE 24” No Bid No Bid

HDPE 30” No Bid No Bid

HDPE 36” No Bid No Bid

HDPE 42" No Bid No Bid

HDPE 48” No Bid No Bid

Contractor's Name: Kuhiman Corp

Unit Price Delivered Unit Price Picked-Up

RCP 127 No Bid No Bid
RCP 15” No Bid No Bid
RCP 18” No Bid No Bid
RCP 217 No Bid No Bid
RCP 24~ No Bid No Bid
RCP 27~ No Bid No Bid
RCP 30” No Bid No Bid
RCP 36” No Bid No Bid
RCP 42" No Bid No Bid
RCP 48" No Bid No Bid
HDPE 12" $4.01/LIN FT No Bid
HDPE 18" $7.71/LIN FT No Bid
HDPE 24” $12.46/LIN FT No Bid
HDPE 30” $18.18/LIN FT No Bid
HDPE 36” $23.08/LIN FT No Bid
HDPE 42~ $30.48/LIN FT No Bid
HDPE 48~ $38.79/LIN FT No Bid

The Bids will be reviewed.

c: Assistant Clerk



