

March 2, 2017

IN THE MATTER OF
RECEIVING BIDS FOR
SUPPLYING ASPHALT CONCRETE,
BITUMINOUS, RUBBERIZED CRACK SEAL,
FOG SEAL MATERIALS

It being the hour of 11:45 a.m., the time set by the Board of Ottawa County Commissioners for the bid opening for Supplying of Asphalt Concrete, Bituminous, Rubberized Crack Seal, and Fog Seal Materials the following bid(s) were received:

Asphalt Materials

Asphalt Concrete Type 1 #448: no bid

Asphalt Concrete Base #301: no bid

Cold Patch Material – no bid

HFRS – 2: \$1.51/gallon – delivered \$1.4503/gallon – picked-up

MWS – 90: \$1.51/gallon – delivered \$1.4503/gallon – picked-up

SS-1H - \$1.65/gallon – delivered \$1.5903/gallon – picked-up

ODOT Type 1 #423: no bid

QF-40: \$1.2797/gallon – delivered \$1.22/gallon – picked up

Grip Tight “A” – no bid

Erie Materials

Asphalt Concrete Type 1 #448: \$66.00/ton – delivered \$56.00/ton picked-up

Asphalt Concrete Base #301: \$57.00/ton – delivered \$47.00/ton picked-up

Cold Patch Material - \$110/ton delivered \$100/ton - picked up

HFRS – 2: no bid

MWS – 90: no bid

SS-1H – no bid

ODOT Type 1 #423: no bid

QF-40: no bid

Grip Tight “A” – no bid

Shelly, Inc/Stoneco

Asphalt Concrete Type 1 #448: no bid – delivered \$58.50/ton picked-up

Asphalt Concrete Base #301: no bid – delivered \$49.00/ton picked

Cold Patch Material – no bid – delivered \$106.50/ton picked-up

HFRS – 2: no bid

MWS – 90: no bid

SS-1H: no bid

ODOT Type 1 #423: no bid

QF-40: no bid

Grip Tight “A” – no bid

Kokosing

Asphalt Concrete Type 1 #448: no bid	\$59.00/ton picked-up
Asphalt Concrete Base #301: no bid	\$49.00/ton picked-up
Cold Patch Material – no bid	
HFRS – 2: no bid	
MWS – 90: no bid	
SS-1H: no bid	
ODOT Type 1 #423: no bid	
QF-40: no bid	
Grip Tight “A” – no bid	

Seal Master

Asphalt Concrete Type 1 #448: no bid	
Asphalt Concrete Base #301: no bid	
Cold Patch Material – no bid	
HFRS – 2: no bid	
MWS – 90: no bid	
SS-1H: no bid	
ODOT Type 1 #423: \$.455/lb. – delivered	\$.44/lb. – picked-up
QF-40: no bid	
Grip Tight “A” – no bid	

The Bid(s) will be reviewed.