

# 2022 Pipe Bid Results

All Prices are listed in a PER LINEAL FOOT rate

Pipe	Core & Main	
	Unit Price Delivered	Unit Price Picked-Up
<b>HDPE</b>		
12"	\$6.09	\$5.96
15"	\$8.69	\$8.52
18"	\$12.13	\$11.88
21"	NO BID	NO BID
24"	\$20.83	\$20.45
27"	NO BID	NO BID
30"	\$27.96	\$27.38
36"	\$37.04	\$36.26
42"	\$45.91	\$44.94
48"	\$59.37	\$58.13
Discount Terms		

Pick Up Location:

Findlay, Ohio or Napoleon, Ohio

Notes

Pickup location to be determined by availability.