

# 2012 Pipe Bid Results

All Prices are listed in a PER **LINEAL FOOT** rate

Pipe	HD Supply Waterworks		Hanson Pipe & Precast		Independent Concrete Pipe	
	Unit Price Delivered	Unit Price Picked-Up	Unit Price Delivered	Unit Price Picked-Up	Unit Price Delivered	Unit Price Picked-Up
<b>RCP - Class 3</b>						
12"			No Bid	No Bid	\$7.15	\$6.30
15"			No Bid	No Bid	\$9.10	\$8.00
18"			\$17.45	\$15.75	\$11.40	\$10.00
21"			\$23.60	\$21.00	\$14.55	\$12.85
24"			\$27.70	\$24.50	\$20.10	\$17.75
27"			\$33.90	\$29.75	\$25.55	\$22.55
30"			\$42.00	\$36.75	\$30.25	\$26.65
36"			\$56.40	\$49.00	\$39.65	\$34.75
42"			\$85.10	\$73.50	\$50.55	\$44.55
48"			\$103.55	\$89.25	\$61.25	\$54.35
<b>RCP - Class 4</b>						
12"			\$12.30	\$10.50		
15"			\$16.40	\$14.00		
<b>HDPE</b>						
12"	4.50	4.45				
18"	9.05	8.80				
24"	14.10	13.75				
30"	21.30	20.75				
36"	25.70	25.00				
42"	31.50	30.65				
48"	43.50	42.25				
Discount Terms	N/A		N/A		Net 30	

Pick Up Location:

26812 Eckel Road Perrysburg Ohio

1500 Haul Road Columbus, Ohio

3756 Centennial Road Sylvania Ohio