

## 2014 Aggregate Bulk Bid

Stone	Erie Materials		LaFarge N America		Lockport Transportation		Shelly Materials Genoa		StoneCo Clay Center	
	Unit Price Delivered	Unit Price Picked-Up	Unit Price Delivered	Unit Price Picked-Up	Unit Price Delivered	Unit Price Picked-Up	Unit Price Delivered	Unit Price Picked-Up	Unit Price Delivered	Unit Price Picked-Up
# 1 & 2	12.50	8.00	15.25	9.75	13.50	8.50	12.75	8.35	13.50	9.15
# 57	15.00	10.50	16.10	10.60	13.75	8.75	13.15	8.75	14.20	9.85
# 6	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	13.75	8.75	13.15	8.75	14.20	9.85
# 4	12.50	8.00	15.25	9.75	13.75	8.75	12.75	8.35	13.45	9.10
# 67	NO BID	NO BID	16.65	11.15	13.75	8.75	13.25	8.85	14.20	9.85
# 8	15.00	10.50	16.65	11.15	13.85	8.85	13.35	8.95	14.20	9.85
# 10	NO BID	NO BID	13.50	8.00	11.50	6.50	7.90	3.50	11.60	7.25
# 9	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	13.25	8.25	NO BID	NO BID	11.35	7.00
# 304	10.50	6.00	12.80	7.30	11.70	6.70	9.65	5.25	11.70	7.35
# 411	10.50	6.00	13.80	8.30	11.70	6.70	9.65	5.25	11.70	7.35
Rip Rap A	27.50	23.00	34.50	26.50	22.00	17.00	NO BID	NO BID	27.85	19.50
Rip Rap B	22.50	18.00	32.00	24.00	21.50	16.50	NO BID	NO BID	26.85	18.50
Rip Rap C	21.00	16.50	30.50	22.50	21.50	16.50	NO BID	NO BID	24.10	15.75
Rip Rap D	16.00	11.50	26.00	18.50	22.00	17.00	NO BID	NO BID	18.10	13.75
Natural Sand	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	19.25	14.25	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Manufactured Sand	11.00	6.50	NO BID	NO BID	11.00	6.00	NO BID	NO BID	10.85	6.50

Discount Terms	N/A	N/A	Net 30 Days	Net 30 Days	Net 30 Days
Pick Up Location	4507 Tiffin Ave., Sandusky	831 S Quarry Rd, Marblehead	659 Anderson Rd, Woodville	677 Genoa-Clay Center, Genoa	3800 Bolander Rd, Clay Center