

2015 Pipe Bid Results

All Prices are listed in a PER **LINEAL FOOT** rate

Pipe	Northern Concrete Pipe	
	Unit Price Delivered	Unit Price Picked-Up
RCP - Class 3		
12"	\$9.24	\$8.25
15"	\$11.22	\$10.05
18"	\$13.80	\$12.35
21"	\$16.80	\$15.00
24"	\$20.04	\$17.90
27"	\$29.16	\$26.30
30"	\$32.88	\$29.65
36"	\$45.30	\$40.85
42"	\$60.96	\$54.95
48"	\$78.30	\$70.60
HDPE		
12"	No Bid	No Bid
15"	No Bid	No Bid
18"	No Bid	No Bid
21"	No Bid	No Bid
24"	No Bid	No Bid
27"	No Bid	No Bid
30"	No Bid	No Bid
36"	No Bid	No Bid
42"	No Bid	No Bid
48"	No Bid	No Bid
Discount Terms	N/A	

Pick Up Location: 3756 Centennial Road, Sylvania Ohio

Notes: Prices are based on full truck load deliveries.
There is a \$400 charge for short loads