2017 Pipe Bid Results
All Prices are listed in a PER LINEAL FOOT rate

Pipe Northern Concrete Pipe
Unit Price Delivered Unit Price Picked-Up
RCP - Class 3
1 $9.90 $8.75
- $12.06 $10.65
18" $14.82 $13.09
o $18.00 $15.90
g $21.48 $18.97
- $31.56 $27.88
30" $35.58 $31.43
o $49.02 $43.30
” $65.94 $58.25
' $84.72 $74.84
HDPE
. No Bid No Bid
. No Bid No Bid
15
- No Bid No Bid
. No Bid No Bid
21
i No Bid No Bid
§ No Bid No Bid
27
20" No Bid No Bid
§ No Bid No Bid
36
- No Bid No Bid
§ No Bid No Bid
48
Discount Terms NIA
Pick Up Location: 3756 Centennial Road, Sylvania Ohio
Pricing includes rubber gaskets for joints. Discounts may be applied for plain joint
pipe. Pricing is based on full truck load deliveries. There will be an additional
Notes charge of $400.00 for short loads.
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