

March 22, 2018

IN THE MATTER OF
RECEIVING BIDS FOR RE-BID
SUPPLYING OF AGGREGATE

It being the hour of 10:30 a.m., the time set by the Board of Ottawa County Commissioners for the bid opening for the Re-bid of 2018 Supplying of Aggregate the following bid(s) were received:

| <u>Erie Materials</u> | <u>Delivered</u> | <u>Picked-Up</u> |
|-----------------------|------------------|------------------|
| #1&2 | \$19.00/ton | \$13.00/ton |
| #57 | \$20.00/ton | \$14.00/ton |
| #6 | no bid | no bid |
| #4 | \$19.00/ton | \$13.00/ton |
| #67 | no bid | no bid |
| #8 | \$21.00/ton | \$15.00/ton |
| #8 Washed | \$21.00/ton | \$15.00/ton |
| #9 | \$14.50/ton | \$8.50/ton |
| #10 | no bid | no bid |
| #304 | \$14.25/ton | \$8.25/ton |
| #411 | \$14.25/ton | \$8.25/ton |
| Rip Rap A | \$38.00/ton | \$29.00/ton |
| Rip Rap B | \$32.00/ton | \$24.00/ton |
| Rip Rap C | \$30.00/ton | \$23.00/ton |
| Rip Rap D | \$23.50/ton | \$17.50/ton |
| Natural Sand | no bid | no bid |
| Manufactured Sand | \$15.75/ton | \$9.75/ton |

| <u>Lafarge</u> | <u>Delivered</u> | <u>Picked-Up</u> |
|-------------------|------------------|------------------|
| #1&2 | no bid | \$11.65/ton |
| #57 | no bid | \$13.00/ton |
| #6 | no bid | no bid |
| #4 | no bid | \$11.85/ton |
| #67 | no bid | \$13.85/ton |
| #8 | no bid | \$13.60/ton |
| #8 Washed | no bid | \$13.60/ton |
| #9 | no bid | no bid |
| #10 | no bid | no bid |
| #304 | no bid | \$8.95/ton |
| #411 | no bid | \$9.70/ton |
| Rip Rap A | no bid | \$29.40/ton |
| Rip Rap B | no bid | \$27.30/ton |
| Rip Rap C | no bid | \$26.25/ton |
| Rip Rap D | no bid | \$23.45/ton |
| Natural Sand | no bid | no bid |
| Manufactured Sand | no bid | \$10.75/ton |

| <u>Area Aggregators</u> | <u>Delivered</u> | <u>Picked-Up</u> |
|-------------------------|------------------|------------------|
| #1&2 | \$13.40/ton | \$8.00/ton |
| #57 | \$14.40/ton | \$9.00/ton |
| #6 | \$14.40/ton | \$9.00/ton |
| #4 | \$13.40/ton | \$8.00/ton |
| #67 | \$15.40/ton | \$10.00/ton |
| #8 | \$15.40/ton | \$10.00/ton |
| #8 Washed | \$15.40/ton | \$10.00/ton |
| #9 | \$13.40/ton | \$8.00/ton |
| #10 | \$9.90/ton | \$4.50/ton |
| #304 | \$11.40/ton | \$6.00/ton |
| #411 | \$11.65/ton | \$6.25/ton |
| Rip Rap A | \$36.40/ton | \$28.00/ton |
| Rip Rap B | \$30.00/ton | \$21.60/ton |
| Rip Rap C | \$28.00/ton | \$19.60/ton |
| Rip Rap D | \$22.15/ton | \$16.75/ton |
| Natural Sand | \$23.00/ton | \$17.60/ton |
| Manufactured Sand | \$23.00/ton | \$17.60/ton |

| <u>Shelly/Stone Co. – Genoa</u> | <u>Delivered</u> | <u>Picked-Up</u> |
|---------------------------------|------------------|------------------|
| #1&2 | \$15.25/ton | \$10.25/ton |
| #57 | \$16.25/ton | \$11.25/ton |
| #6 | \$16.25/ton | \$11.25/ton |
| #4 | \$15.45/ton | \$10.45/ton |
| #67 | no bid | no bid |
| #8 | \$17.40/ton | \$12.40/ton |
| #8 Washed | no bid | no bid |
| #9 | no bid | no bid |
| #10 | \$11.35/ton | \$6.35/ton |
| #304 | \$12.65/ton | \$7.65/ton |
| #411 | \$12.65/ton | \$7.65/ton |
| Rip Rap A | no bid | no bid |
| Rip Rap B | no bid | no bid |
| Rip Rap C | no bid | no bid |
| Rip Rap D | no bid | no bid |
| Natural Sand | no bid | no bid |
| Manufactured Sand | no bid | no bid |

| <u>Shelly/Stone Co. – Clay Center</u> | <u>Delivered</u> | <u>Picked-Up</u> |
|---|------------------|------------------|
| #1&2 | \$16.00/ton | \$11.00/ton |
| #57 | \$17.00/ton | \$12.00/ton |
| #6 | \$17.00/ton | \$12.00/ton |
| #4 | \$16.00/ton | \$11.00/ton |
| #67 | \$17.75/ton | \$12.75/ton |
| #8 | \$17.85/ton | \$12.85/ton |
| #8 Washed | \$17.85/ton | \$12.85/ton |
| #9 | \$10.50/ton | \$5.50/ton |
| #10 | \$13.50/ton | \$8.50/ton |
| #304 | \$13.50/ton | \$8.50/ton |
| #411 | \$13.50/ton | \$8.50/ton |
| Rip Rap A | no bid | no bid |
| Rip Rap B | no bid | no bid |
| Rip Rap C | \$30.00/ton | \$22.00/ton |
| Rip Rap D | \$22.50/ton | \$17.50/ton |
| Natural Sand | no bid | no bid |
| Manufactured Sand | \$13.50/ton | \$8.50/ton |

The bids will be reviewed.