

December 22, 2020

IN THE MATTER OF
RECEIVING BIDS FOR
SUPPLYING ASPHALT CONCRETE,
BITUMINOUS MATERIALS

It being the hour of 11:15 a.m., the time set by the Board of Ottawa County Commissioners for the bid opening for Supplying of Asphalt Concrete and Bituminous Materials the following bid(s) were received:

Shelly Materials

Asphalt Concrete Type 1 #448:	no bid – delivered	\$68.50/ton - picked-up
Asphalt Concrete Base #301:	no bid - delivered	\$57.50/ton – picked-up
Cold Patch Material:	no bid - delivered	\$110.00/ton – picked-up

Kokosing Materials

Asphalt Concrete Type 1 #448:	no bid – delivered	\$61.00/ton - picked-up
Asphalt Concrete Base #301:	no bid - delivered	\$54.00/ton – picked-up
Cold Patch Material:	no bid – delivered	no bid

Erie Materials, Inc.

Asphalt Concrete Type 1 #448:	\$70.00/ton - delivered	\$62.00/ton - picked-up
Asphalt Concrete Base #301:	\$62.00/ton – delivered	\$54.00/ton – picked-up
Cold Patch Material:	\$120.00/ton – delivered	\$110.00/ton – picked-up

Hei-way

Asphalt Concrete Type 1 #448:	no bid – delivered	no bid - picked-up
Asphalt Concrete Base #301:	no bid - delivered	no bid - picked-up
Cold Patch Material:	\$107.00/ton – delivered	no bid- picked-up
	\$8/bag - delivered	no bid– picked-up

Gerken Materials

Asphalt Concrete Type 1 #448:	no bid – delivered	\$66.00/ton - picked-up
Asphalt Concrete Base #301:	no bid - delivered	\$58.00/ton – picked-up
Cold Patch Material:	\$130.00/ton – delivered	\$118.00/ton – picked-up

Unique Materials

Asphalt Concrete Type 1 #448:	no bid – delivered	no bid - picked-up
Asphalt Concrete Base #301:	no bid - delivered	no bid – picked-up
Cold Patch Material:	\$121.50/ton – delivered	\$110.75/ton – picked-up
	\$10.75/bag – delivered	\$8.50/bag – picked-up
	\$10.05/bag - delivered	

The Bid(s) will be reviewed.